
South Cirby Neighborhood Association Meeting Minutes

October 8th, 2013
7:00 p.m.

Crestmont Elementary School Multi-Purpose Room

Present: Stephen Costello, Colleen Cole, Marilyn Floyd, Joe Dorr, Helen Dorr, 
Dave McGovern, David Sears, LaRon Golden and Officer Tyler Wolters

Meeting called to order by Stephen Costello. Stephen Costello welcomed 
everyone and introduced the board.

Meeting minutes from 8/13/13 were approved with one correction to Banking is 
buying checks would be $14.00 instead of the $12.00 stated in the minutes.
Meeting minutes from 9/10/13 were approved without any corrections.

Treasurer’s Report: $149.00. There were no transactions in the last month. We 
are not receiving statements from the bank. They have been combined and sent 
to RCONA. Colleen contacted bank to verify address to receive statements.

Roseville Police Officer: Officer Tyler Wolters attended the meeting. The activity 
in our area consists of thefts to homes,autos and catalytic converters (most 
recently on Dodge trucks). Officer Wolters suggested locking up your home and 
car. Remove valuables from the car and get your catalytic converter etched.

RCONA Meeting Notes and Updates: Colleen stated attending RCONA meetings 
is a way to utilize some help as many of the other NA’s attending the meeting 
have very good ideas.  

Update on Cirby Wall: Colleen trying to find out how to get the paint color to 
cover the graffiti a consistent color. Officer Dan Stokes suggested attending City 
Council Meetings as an effort to get the paint a consistent color. Colleen to report 
more information at the next meeting.

Update on Neighborhood Watch Program and Meeting: 19 people attended the 
Block Captain Meeting at Cool River Pizza on 10/7/13 presented by Mary Helen 
Ivers, Lt. Cal Walstad, Sergeant Darren Kato, and Officer Dan Stokes. Officer 
Dan Stokes requested residents leave their outdoor front lights on all night. This 
allows him the ability to see any activity as he is rolling down the street with the 
windows down and lights off while checking on our property. 



Colleen is helping Annette Gillespie with some of the block captain 
administration.

RCONA Event Suggestion Planner: RCONA has an event planner they would like 
NAs to fill out to assist the RCONA board in planning their budget.

RCONA Committee Interest: RCONA has some committees needing committee 
members.

Neighborhood Watch Signs: Need to check on size and price. Colleen to meet 
with Jim Kidd of the Maidu NA and report back at the next meeting. Dave 
McGovern suggested a pizza night at Cool River to get neighbors together and 
we would place a jar for donations to help pay for the Neighborhood Watch Signs 
or other expenses.

RCONA Representative for the next RCONA Meeting 10/17/13: Stephen Costello 
to attend. Marilyn Floyd backup representative if Stephen cannot attend.

Newsletter Frequency and Cost: Board Member Dave McGovern volunteered to 
produce the electronic newsletter. Stephen to look at the cost of a quarterly paper 
edition and costs of sponsorships to pay for the newsletter. LaRon Golden 
offered to deliver newsletters in zone 3 of neighborhood.

Prior to adjourning the meeting, it was discussed to have 4 events a year for the 
neighborhood to get together. National Night Out, Pizza at Cool River, and 
piggybacking Maidu’s Santa in the Park if we can coordinate with the other NA.

Next Meeting: November 12th, 7:00 p.m. in the Crestmont School Multi-Purpose 
Room.
Meeting adjourned at 8:10 p.m. 

Respectfully submitted, 
Marilyn Floyd, Secretary 


